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Mattress Tape Edger

Posting date: 01 September 2021

Hours: Full time

Closing date: 01 October 2021

Location: Ossett WF5 9NJ

Company: Deepsleep Beds UK Ltd

Job type: Permanent

Job reference:

Summary

Deepsleep Beds UK Ltd

Recruiting for Mattress Tape Edger.

Due to continued success and growth Deepsleep
Beds UK Ltd, Ossett, WF5 9NJ are currently
recruiting for Mattress Tape Edger to join their
successful team, which manufactures some of the
markets leading beds.

This is a fantastic opportunity to work for one of
the markets leading bed manufacturer that is
expanding with great ambition.

Save to favourites

Print this job

Share this job via
email

Report this job
(/report/6727617)

Related jobs

Mattress Clippers
(https://findajob.dwp.gov.
uk/details/6727530)
Ossett WF5 9NJ

Mattress Tufter
(https://findajob.dwp.gov.
uk/details/6727691)
Ossett WF5 9NJ

Production Operative
(https://findajob.dwp.gov.
uk/details/6626527)
Beeston, Yorkshire,
LS115SN
£18,252 per year

Packing Operative -
NIGHTS
(https://findajob.dwp.gov.
uk/details/6646775)
WF14 0EH
£8.91 per hour

Packing Operative
(https://findajob.dwp.gov.
uk/details/6646776)
WF14 0EH
£8.91 per hour
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The successful candidates will be working in a
busy bed manufacturing factory in the heart of
Yorkshire deploying their mattress tape edging
skills in manufacturing beds in a fantastic work
ethic environment where the health and safety of
its employees is of paramount.

What we offer:

Competitive rates of pay for the highly skilled
(Salary £18,532.80 - £20,800) dependent on
experience and skill.

Hours of work 7 am – 4 pm, occasional Saturday
work.

Free private & secure staff parking available

Onsite canteen with snacks, hot and cold drinks
available

Generous holiday allowance

Requirements:

Must have mattress tape edging experience.

Candidate must be organised, hardworking,
enthusiastic and passionate about the job.

Good time keeping is essential

Good house keeping

Good work ethic

Compliant with the companies Health and Safety
Policy, being careful to look after yourself and
others whilst at work.

Able to work in a team and contribute to the team

Flair for detail, accuracy, quality in a fast paced
environment with a positive attitude to work

Work with energy and to achievable deadlines
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IMMEDIATE START, serious candidates please
call 07865 749 394 to arrange an interview or
alternatively email your C.V/contact details to
hr@deepsleepbeds.co.uk No agencies please
unless candidates are highly skilled.

« Return to the search results
(https://findajob.dwp.gov.uk/search/?q=mattress&
w=UK)
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Find a job (https://findajob.dwp.gov.uk)

Mattress Tufter

Posting date: 01 September 2021

Hours: Full time

Closing date: 01 October 2021

Location: Ossett WF5 9NJ

Company: Deepsleep Beds UK Ltd

Job type: Permanent

Job reference:

Summary

Deepsleep Beds UK Ltd

Recruiting for Mattress Tufter.

Due to continued success and growth Deepsleep
Beds UK Ltd, Ossett, WF5 9NJ are currently
recruiting for Mattress Tufter to join their
successful team, which manufactures some of the
markets leading beds.

This is a fantastic opportunity to work for one of
the markets leading bed manufacturer that is
expanding with great ambition.

Save to favourites

Print this job

Share this job via
email

Report this job
(/report/6727691)

Related jobs

Mattress Clippers
(https://findajob.dwp.gov.
uk/details/6727530)
Ossett WF5 9NJ

Mattress Tape Edger
(https://findajob.dwp.gov.
uk/details/6727617)
Ossett WF5 9NJ

Production Operative
(https://findajob.dwp.gov.
uk/details/6626527)
Beeston, Yorkshire,
LS115SN
£18,252 per year

Packing Operative -
NIGHTS
(https://findajob.dwp.gov.
uk/details/6646775)
WF14 0EH
£8.91 per hour

Packing Operative
(https://findajob.dwp.gov.
uk/details/6646776)
WF14 0EH
£8.91 per hour
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The successful candidates will be working in a
busy bed manufacturing factory in the heart of
Yorkshire deploying their mattress tufting skills in
manufacturing beds in a fantastic work ethic
environment where the health and safety of its
employees is of paramount.

What we offer:

Competitive rates of pay for the highly skilled
(Salary £18,532.80 - £20,800) dependent on
experience and skill.

Hours of work 7 am – 4 pm, occasional Saturday
work.

Free private & secure staff parking available

Onsite canteen with snacks, hot and cold drinks
available

Generous holiday allowance

Requirements:

Must have mattress tufting experience.

Candidate must be organised, hardworking,
enthusiastic and passionate about the job.

Good time keeping is essential

Good house keeping

Good work ethic

Compliant with the companies Health and Safety
Policy, being careful to look after yourself and
others whilst at work.

Able to work in a team and contribute to the team

Flair for detail, accuracy, quality in a fast paced
environment with a positive attitude to work

Work with energy and to achievable deadlines
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IMMEDIATE START, serious candidates please
call 07865 749 394 to arrange an interview or
alternatively email your C.V/contact details to
hr@deepsleepbeds.co.uk No agencies please
unless candidates are highly skilled.

« Return to the search results
(https://findajob.dwp.gov.uk/search/?q=mattress&
w=UK)
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